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CORRESPONDENCE 

Agent Orange controversy 
SIR-The report "'Not guilty' verdict chal­
lenged" (Nature 342, 217; 1989) on the 
Evatt Revisited conference1 correctly 
identified one of the reasons for continu­
ing controversy about the Royal Commis­
sion into the Use and Effects of Chemical 
Agents on Australian Personnel in 
Vietnam : the use without acknowledge­
ment in its final report , which concluded 
"Agent Orange: Not Guilty"', of large 
tracts of Monsanto's submission}-8. This 
has , however, been known for some time,.'; 
the main point of the Evatt Revisited 
conference was a reappraisal of scientific 
evidence presented to the commission, 
and published since. In the introductory 
paper, my colleagues and I concluded that 
on balance the evidence now suggests that 
pesticide exposure increases the risks of 
some cancers and birth defects , but that 
there is uncertainty about this conclusion 
that, at least in the case of the Vietnam 
veterans , is unlikely to be resolved by 
further research". This is consistent with 
reports since the Evatt Commission by the 
International Agency for Research on 
Cancer and the USAF School of Aero­
space Medicine, as well as several 
research papers"-16

, but other authors still 
defend the commission's unqualified 
exoneration of Agent Orange, dioxins and 
other chemicals used in the war17

-
21
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Which of these studies should be accep­
ted , and what level of proof to apply , is a 
social choice on which scientists can only 
advise ; there is no statistical algorithm 
that will convert a controversial and con­
fused situation into a simple objective 
truth that absolves society from making 
choices that involve value judgments. The 
traditional scientific stance of scepticism 
and critical rigour guards against errors of 
credulity, and in this case happens to 
favour chemical companies and govern­
ments against the veterans; but it is pos­
sible to be in error because of excessive 
scepticism as much as credulity, and in this 
case to deny the veterans just treatment. 

In The Politics of Agent Orange22
, 

McCulloch argued that epidemiology 
"cannot resolve the problem of public 
responsibility for the suffering of the 
veterans" , and speculated prophetically: 
"Perhaps the specialists will reveal even­
tually that it is not possible to prove or 
disprove that the veterans are ill because 
of chemical exposure which occurred in 
the RVN [Republic of Vietnam)". It is 
obvious that social decisions based on con­
flicting scientific evidence and opinion 
must be made under uncertainty (many 
philosophers would argue that all deci­
sions are inevitably of this type) , and 
involve issues of trust, justice and equity 
as well as theoretical knowledge and tech­
nical competence. To me the critical 
ethical issue is the question raised at Evatt 
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Revisited by Professor Axelson as well as 
myself: "who gets the benefit of the 
doubt?" The organizers of Evatt Revisited 
have presented social justice arguments 
that the veterans should be given the 
benefit of the doubt in this case' . 
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Reprint solidarity 
SIR- I agree with Alexander C. Leung 
(Nature 339, 574; 1989) that "reprints are 
costly to authors and should not be 
requested unless there is a really good 
reason for it". However, for most of us 
working in Poland (and I believe in most 
Eastern European countries) reprints are 
the only available source of scientific 
information. As a neuropathologist and 
electron microscopist , I have no access to 
any neuropathological or electron micro­
scopical journal, let alone books. 

I cannot read an article before request­
ing a reprint , as I know the title of the 
article only through Current Contents or 
from the bibliography section of another 
article. Even sending a request for a 
reprint is expensive, as in many situations 
I have to pay for requests from my own 

pocket. Even if I have access to journals, I 
would not be able to make a photocopy as 
such a service is almost non-existent in 
scientific libraries in Poland. It could be 
said that working in such conditions is my 
choice, but every time I obtain a reprint I 
have a feeling of understanding and inter­
national 'solidarity' among scientists. 
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CF screening 
SIR-We disagree with L. P. Ten Kate 
(Nature 342 , 131; 1989) who argues that 
screening of cystic fibrosis (CF) carriers 
should be delayed until detection of 96 per 
cent of all mutated genes would be poss­
ible . It is certainly true that anxiety of 
couples with one carrier of the F5<,, dele­
tion would be increased by knowledge of 
their situation . Nevertheless, we consider 
that it would be unethical to neglect the 
possibility of informing about 50 per cent 
of the couples with a 0.25 risk of having a 
CF child that an ante-natal diagnosis is 
available to them. We propose that 
couples should be offered the possibility 
of being screened for the F 508 deletion 
while being explicitly told that (1) the 
procedure will fail to detect the risk in 
about 50 per cent of the cases, and (2) only 
if both of them were carriers of the 
mutation would they be informed of a 
positive result. By doing so , the possibility 
of helping 50 per cent of couples at risk of 
having a CF child would not be sacrificed 
to the psychological comfort of the others. 
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Fine writing? 
SIR-In your leading article "Adiron­
dacks awake" (Nature 343, 101; 1990), 
you mention the New Yorker's "devotion 
to fine writing" and its commissioning of 
"fine writers". The first sentence in the 
third paragraph, a quotation from one of 
these "fine writers" , reads "A forty­
minute hike brings the dog and I to the top 
of the hill behind my home" . Presumably 
if the writer had gone unaccompanied , it 
would have read "A forty-minute hike 
brings I to the top of the hill behind my 
home" . Perchance the big apple hath a 
worm betwixt its rosy cheeks. 

BRADFORD D. PEARSON 

7431 Lindsay Road, 
Richmond, BC V7C 3M7, Canada 

NATURE · VOL 343 · 15 FEBRUARY 1990 


	Fine writing?

