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anthropologists who were in China as well 
and by his former wife, who is Chinese. His 
alleged misdoings range from financial ir­
regularities to smuggling, and being an 
intelligence agent, which he denies. The 
head of the Stanford anthropology depart­
ment, Clifford Barnett, says the secret 
faculty report does not even discuss the 
rumour that Mosher was an intelligence 
agent. 

Stanford interviewed Mosher's ex-wife 
but is not telling Mosher her present where­
abouts. Under Stanford's procedures 
Mosher was given a chance to see the 
"evidence" against him and to refute it. 

The incident raises questions about how 
anthropologists should conduct them­
selves in states such as China unused to 
having Westerners observe ordinary life. 

The Stanford faculty has issued a state­
ment saying that his publication of the 
Taiwan weekly article did not amount to 
"misconduct". The statement does, 
however, say that the anthropologist should 
be' 'open and honest in accounting to others 
in the profession about his behaviour in the. 
field". It says anthropologists should "pro-

Oil pollution 

teet the confidentiality" of those who pro­
vide them with information and "an­
ticipate'' the impact on the populations they 
study of dissemination of their research. 
Further, the statement mentions "protec­
ting the good name" of the discipline by 
"abstaining from activities while in the field 
that are judged to be 'illegal' in areas where 
they work". 

Other anthropologists are sympathetic 
to Mosher's outrage over Chinese birth 
control practices, accounts of which have 
filtered out of China in recent months. 
Thus Kenneth Pruitt, president of the 
Social Sciences Research Council, who is 
familiar with the case, says that Mosher 
had an obligation to let world public opi­
nion know. ''But he also had an obligation 
to put it in perspective." Pruitt acknow­
ledged that other factors besides the birth 
control issue had been important in the 
Stanford faculty's decision. 

Says Mosher, "I never had a course in 
ethics in anthropology when I was at Stan­
ford. Now they give a course in it. And you 
can be sure that it is thanks to Steven 
Westley Mosher." Deborah Shapley 

North Sea still suffering 
Brussels 
IN spite of the bewildering number of inter­
national conventions that have been 
negotiated, the voices clamouring for 
urgent action to clean up the North Sea are 
growing stronger. At the last meeting of the 
European Community's environmental 
ministers at the end of February, the West 
German Government put forward its sug­
gestions for another international con­
ference on the problem. And at the Euro­
pean Parliament's March session, the 
European Commission was urged to create 
a North Sea pollution police force. 

Next October, the Marpol treaty will 
come into force, adding yet another inter­
national agreement to the Oslo, Bonn, 
Paris and London treaties. Yet all the 
evidence available, and in particular the 

Oil spills: The number of incidents reported 
between 1973 and 1981 in eastern Scotland, 
the Orkneys and the Shetland Islands (those 
parts of the British coastline which border 
onto the North Sea) and the North Sea off­
shore oilfields. Source: Annual Reports of 
the Advisory Committee on Oil Pollution of 
the Sea 1973-/981. 
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disturbing reports from Heligoland Bird 
Observatory, points to increases in the 
number of birds killed by oil pollution and 
the ineffectiveness of these treaties in con­
trolling the discharges made by ships at sea. 

The West German memorandum was 
well received by the other EEC countries. It 
stressed the need for intensive aerial 
surveillance of the North Sea to trace the 
origins of the oil spills, tougher fines for 
those caught polluting and improved 
technical pollution control at ports for oil 
and other installations. The goal of the pro­
posed conference would be to find prac­
tical ways of compensating for the short­
comings of existing management policies. 

The European Parliament proposed that 
ships carrying dangerous cargoes should 
have to carry a "black box" similar to that 
used in aircraft to provide an automatic 
recording of a ship's movements. But, as 
one Belgian parliamentarian pointed out, 
phosphates, chlorides and radioactive 
materials also need monitoring. 

In October, environmentalists in the 
Netherlands will be trying to lay the blame 
on some of the worst offenders. An inter­
national water tribunal will present cases 
against major petrochemical companies. 
Independent jurists will be asked to judge 
the cases and the accused will be able to de­
fend themselves. 

Meanwhile, theAmocoCadizdisasterof 
March 1978 is now coming to court in 
Chicago, where 76 Breton communities 
and the French Government are seeking 
compensation. In a comparable case in the 
United States, the damage claim was 
honoured to the tune of $43,000 per tonne 
of spilt oil. Jasper Becker 
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Verdict awaited 
JuDGEMENT has now been completed in the 
case, which may be the first of a series in 
Britain, to decide whether a regional coun­
cil (in this case Strathclyde) may legally add 
fluoride to its domestic drinking water sup­
ply. Lord Jauncey, an eminent Scottish 
judge, has been considering the question 
since last July after a petition that took a 
record 205 court days to hear and costs 
more than £1 million. It is understood that 
the judgement is now being typed, which 
may itself take some time if the volume of 
evidence in the case is anything to go by. 

In October 1978 an interim interdict was 
applied for in the Edinburgh Court of Ses­
sion to prevent the regional council, as the 
water authority, from adding fluoride to 
the water supply of an old-age pensioner 
living in Glasgow, Mrs Catherine McColl. 
The hearing before Lord Jauncey started 
on 23 September 1980: Mrs McColl made a 
brief appearance at the start of the petition 
and has not been seen since. Subsequent 
witnesses included the well known US op­
ponents of fluoridation, Dr John Yia­
mouyiannis and Dr Jean Burk, who 
concentrated on their contention that 
fluoride can cause cancer (although sundry 
other ailments are listed in Mrs McColl's 
petition). The link with cancer comes 
almost entirely from a study by Dr 
Yiamouyannis published in the journal 
Fluoride of the International Society for 
Fluoride Research (the journal is not 
refereed and Dr Yiamouyannis is a co­
editor). 

For the water authority an impressive 
range of expert witnesses argued against 
the claims of the anti-fluoridation lobby, 
notably Sir Richard Doll, former Regius 
Professor of Medicine at the University of 
Oxford and Professor J .J. Murray of the 
University of Newcastle upon Tyne. These 
and others spent many days explaining 
methodological flaws in the Burk­
Yiamouyiannis evidence and studies pur­
porting to show that fluoride is ineffective 
in preventing dental caries, and also 
presented contrary evidence of their own. 

The water authority is required by law to 
provide "wholesome water", but Parlia­
ment has never attempted legislation on the 
fluoride question - although 10 per cent 
of the British population now drinks arti­
ficially fluoridated water. Strathclyde will 
be a test case for Britain. The courts in the 
United States have consistently found that 
water fluoridation is not a violation of in­
dividual or religious liberty, and more than 
half the states have ruled that any infringe­
ment of freedom to act by mandatory 
fluoridation is minimal, compared with its 
value as a preventive measure. 

The health authorities in Scotland that 
first asked for fluoridation are resigned to a 
long wait. Whichever side loses will appeal, 
and the case is likely to end up in the House 
of Lords. Tim Beardsley 
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