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Some worthy publicity for elastin 
A. Serafini-Fracassini 

Biology and Pathology of Elastic Tissues. 
Frontiers of Matrix Biology, Vo1.8. Edited 
by A.M. Robert and L. Robert. Pp.230. 
(S. Karger: 1980.) $74.25, SwFr.124. 

THIS book attempts to expound, for the 
benefit of graduate students and profes­
sional investigators, various areas of 
scientific research which are contained 
within the subject of molecular biology and 
pathology of elastin. This is undoubtedly a 
topic of considerable importance to bio­
chemical and medical workers, and one 
which has attracted a large amount of 
research over the past two decades. As 
unambiguous interpretations of functional 
properties of the protein stilI prove elusive, 
it is of some value to have, brought 
together in one volume, a collection of 
critical evaluations of some recent 
findings. The earlier contributions in the 
book deal with structural and con­
formational aspects of the protein, while 
the others discuss its implication in the 
inflammatory response and in some tissue 
disorders. The role of elastases in these 
pathological conditions is adequately 
outlined. However, in this context, one 
would like to have seen included an up-to­
date account of the biosynthesis of elastin, 
with particular reference to the nature of 
the soluble biosynthetic intermediate and 

to the biogenesis of the cross-links. Such a 
chapter would have been of great value to 
an outsider to the subject in appreciating 
the significance of some structural features 
of the protein and in understanding the 
pathogenesis of specific disorders. Other 
aspects which with advantage could have 
been covered more fully are the physico­
chemical properties of elastin, and the 
thermodynamics of its deformation to 
balance Dr Vrry's excellent contribution 
on synthetic repeat polypeptides. 

It is difficult to make a unified 
judgement on this collection of papers 
because the style of the contributions is so 
varied. Some offer an accurate review of 
the relevant scientific research, while 
others mainly outline the results obtained 
in the authors' laboratories, occasionally 
with the exclusion of some lines of research 
that might have merited discussion. This is 
also reflected by the variable number of 
references cited at the end of each chapter. 

The book is well produced, adequately 
illustrated and as a whole very readable. 
Elastin has not yet enjoyed its share of the 
general escalation in scientific pub­
lications, and I consider this a worthy 
collection, one which could be read with 
profit in its entirety by non-specialists. D 
A. Serajini·Pracassini is Professor of Bio· 
chemistry at the University of Sf Andrews. 

Compleat diquat and paraquat 
R.J. Hance 

The Bipyridinium Herbicides. By L.A. 
Summers. Pp.449. (Academic: 1980.) £33, 
$79.50. 

ONLY two bipyridinium herbicides, diquat 
and paraquat, are in widespread use, so it is 
interesting to speculate why they have 
stimulated a book of this size when larger 
groups of herbicides have not. Perhaps 
there are two reasons. The first is the 
enthusiasm of Dr Summers for his subject. 
The second is that, in comparison with 
other herbicides, the peripheral synthetic 
chemistry of these compounds is 
challenging and their toxicology unusual. 
Indeed, these topics occupy almost half the 
book. The remainder covers the chemistry 
of the respective diquaternary salts, 
structure-activity relationships, environ­
mental fate, occurrence and analysis of 
residues, herbicidal use and modes of 
action. 

With 2,500 references cited in little over 
400 pages the text is hard going in places 
but, by intelligent use of tables, the author 
has done his best to avoid producing a 
catalogue. The only reasonable criticism 
that might be made is that not all readers 
will follow the logic underlying the 
sequence in which subjects are presented. 

For instance, the chapters dealing with fate 
in biological systems and with residues are 
separated from that on toxicology and 
environmental effects which in many 
respects is closely related. The layout 
within chapters also occasionally seems 
strange. There is a good example on p.394, 
where a paragraph describing the most 
effective ways of treating paraquat 
poisoning is placed in the middle of a 
section rather than at the end where it 
would have more impact. However, the 
book is sensibly indexed so the reader 
should have little difficulty in finding 
specific information. 

Nowadays, books including a range of 
specialist subjects tend to be multi­
authored. For one man to tackle such a task 
successfully is an impressive feat of 
scholarship and Dr Summers deserves 
warm congratulation. His book 
undoubtedly will become a standard 
reference. It shows, incidentally, that there 
remains a place for books of this type 
alongside the computer-based information 
retrieval systems that seem to threaten their 
viabili ty . [j 

R, J. Hance is leader of the Herbicide Group at 
the Agricultural Research Council Weed 
Research Organization, Yarn ton, near Oxford. 
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